
Rebuild Warranty New Warranty Rebuild Warranty New Warrenty Rebuild

Item 1 WWTP Biosolids Pump Station Unthickened Tank - East Submersible Mixer $6,500.00 1 $12,690.00 5 $8,373.67 1 $23,510.40 1 $7,073.00
Item 2 WWTP Gas Control Building Gas Compressor $13,750.00 1 $32,195.00 1 $4,949.48 1 $30,000.00 1 $6,950.00

Item 3 Pump Station 8 Sewage Lift Pump $9,817.00 1 no bid $8,765.00 1 $17,247.67 1 $10,239.00
Item 4 WWTP North Final Building NonPotable Water Pump $7,770.00 1 no bid $5,956.67 1 $10,527.67 1 $9,585.00

Item 5 WWTP Primary Sludge Pumping Building Primary Sludge Pump $8,250.00 1 $16,548.00 18 months no bid no bid No bid
Item 6 WWTP Anaerobic Sludge Control Building Digester Recirculation Pump $7,157.00 1 $16,993.00 18 months $5,739.52 1 no bid $9,952.00
Item 7 WWTP Gas Control Building Gas Compressor $13,750.00 1 $32,195.00 1 $4,949.48 1 $30,000.00 1 $6,950.00
Item 8 WWTP Gas Control Building Gas Compressor x x $3,380.00 3 x x $3,747.66 5  x 
Item 9 WWTP Anaerobic Sludge Control Building Digester Recirculation Pump x x $16,993.00 18 months x x no bid  x 
Item 10 WWTP Gas Control Building Gas Compressor $3,380.00 1 $3,380.00 3 no bid $3,747.66 5 $4,463.00
Item 11 WWTP Anaerobic Sludge Control Building Digester Recirculation Pump MOT x x $3,380.00 3 x x $3,747.66 5  x 
Item 12 WWTP Gas Control Building Gas Compressor x x $32,195.00 1 x x $30,000.00 1  x 

Recommended

TOTAL JCI Lets, Van Kirk Douglas Pump
$6,500.00 $6,500.00 $4,949.48 $26,900.00

$16,548.00 $16,548.00 $17,247.67
$3,380.00 $3,380.00 $5,956.67

$16,993.00 $16,993.00 $5,739.52
$3,380.00 $3,380.00 $4,949.48
$3,380.00 $3,380.00 $38,842.82
$4,949.48 $50,181.00

$17,247.67
$5,956.67
$5,739.52
$4,949.48

$26,900.00
$115,923.82

JCI Letts



Justification
Warranty New Warranty

1 $24,774.00 1 low bid
1 $26,900.00 1 low bid

1 $18,788.00 1

now aware of other problems 
with this pump, it is cost 

effective to replace with new
1 $12,239.00 1 low bid

$21,514.00 1
have no luck rebuilding these 

units
1 $23,180.00 1 low bid
1 $26,900.00 1 low bid
x $6,507.00 1 low bid
x $23,180.00 1 need spare
1 $6,507.00 1 low bid
x $5,438.00 1 low bid
x $26,900.00 1 low bid
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