ORDINANCE NO. _7380

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF LAWRENCE, KANSAS ADOPTING THE 1997 EDITION OF THE
UNIFORM BUILDING CODE, WITH AMENDMENTS; AMENDING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE 1 OF THE
CODE OF THE CITY OF LAWRENCE, KANSAS, 1997 EDITION AND AMENDMENTS THERETO.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF LAWRENCE, KANSAS:

Section 1. Chapter 5, Article 1 of the Code of the City of Lawrence, Kansas, 1997 Edition and amendments
thereto, is hereby amended to read as follows:

ARTICLE 1. BUILDING CODE

5-101 BUILDING CODE INCORPORATED.
There is hereby adopted by the City that certain Code and Standards known as the Uniform Building
Code, 1997 Edition, Volumes 1,2, and 3, published by the International Conference of Building Offi-
cials, and the whole thereol, save and except such portions as are hereinafter deleted, modified or
amended, and the same are hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof as if set out at
length herein.

5-102 SAME.

Not less than three (3) copies of the Uniform Building Code, 1997 Edition, Volumes 1, 2, and 3,
marked or stamped in the manner provided by K.S.A. 12-3010, with all sections or portions thereof in-
tended to be omitted clearly marked and showing portions that are amended and to which shall be
attached a copy of amendments, shall be filed with the City Clerk and shall be open to inspection and
available to the public at reasonable business hours. Official copies of such Code shall be supplied
at the cost of the City o the officials and agencies in the manner fisted and set forth in K.S.A.12-
3010. Subsequent references to the "Building Code" or "Standard Code" shall mean the "Uniform
Building Code, 1997, Volumes 1, 2, and 3, as adopted herein.

5-103 APPENDIX.
Appendix Chapter 16, Division |, Snow Load Design, Volume 2 of the Uniform Building
Code, 1997 Edition, is hereby specifically adopted.

Appendix Chapter 29, Minimum Plumbing Fixtures.

5-104 AMENDMENTS TO CODE.
The Standard Code is hereby amended and changed in the following respects:

5-104.1 RESERVED.

5-104.2 VIOLATIONS.
Section 103 is hereby amended to read as follows:

it shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move,
improve, remove, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any building or structure in the
City, or cause or permit the same to be done, contrary to or in violation of any of the provisions of this
Code. Any person, firm, or corporation violating any of the provisions of this Code shall be deemed
guilty of a misdemeanor, and each such person shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each
and every day or portion thereof during which any violation of any of the provisions of this Code is
committed, continued, or permitted, and upon conviction of any such violation such person shall be
punishable by a fine of not less than $100 and not more than $500 or by imprisonment for not more
than ninety (90) days, or by both such fine and imprisonment.

Any allegation of a Code violation shall be investigated by the Building Official, or his or her
designee. Should a violation of the Code be found, and said violation is determined by the
Building Official to threaten the health or safety of an individual, the violation shall be



5-104.3

S T

corrected within three (3) business days (exclusive of City holidays) of the date the
responsible party is notified of the violation. In all other cases, Code violations shall be
corrected within thirty (30) days of the date the responsible parity is notified of the violation.

The corrections shall be made by the Responsible Party. For the purposes of this Section,
“Responsible Party” shall mean:

(1) The permit holder for any Code violation(s) found within 12 months of the date of the
final inspection of the structure.

2) The owner of the structure for any Code violation(s) found after 12 months of the date
of the final inspection of the structure.

BOARD OF APPEALS.
Section 105 is hereby amended to read as follows:

(A) Organization and Members. In order to determine the suitability of alternate material and
types of construction and to provide for reasonable interpretations of the provisions of this
Building Code, there shall be and is hereby created a Board of Appeals, consisting of five (5)
members who are qualified by experience and training to pass upon matters pertaining to
construction. Each member of the Board shall be either a licensed professional engineer or
architect, or & contractor, or building superintendent of building construction, shall have at
least ten (10) years experience, for (5) five years of which he or she shall have been in
responsible charge of work; and at no time shall there be more than two members of the
Board selected from the same profession or business; and at least one of the professional
engineers shall be a licensed structural or civil engineer of architectural engineering
experience. The Building Official shall be an ex-officio member and shall act as Secretary to
the Board. The Board of Appeals shall be appointed by the Mayor and shall hold office at
his/her pleasure. Board members shall not be employees of the jurisdiction. The Board shall
adopt reasonable rules and regulations for conducting its investigations and shall render all
decisions and findings in writing to the Building Official with a duplicate copy to the appeflant
and may recommend to the City Commission such new legislation as is consistent therewith.
The Board shall elect or re-elect a Chairman and a Vice Chairman from the membership with
the election to occur annually each December.

(B) Rules. Meetings and Records. The Board may adopt rules to govern its proceedings in
accordance with the provisions of this Article.

(§)] Meetings of the Board shall be held at least once a month or may be held at the call
of the Chairman and at such other times as the Board may determine. All hearings
before the Board shall be open to the public.

2 The Board shall keep minutes of its proceedings, showing the vote of each member
upon every question and/or if absent or failing to vote, indicate such facts.

{(3) The Board shall keep records of hearings, examinations and other action. Such
minutes and such records shall be public record.

(8] Appeals. Any person whose application for a building permit for the use of an alternate
material or type of construction has been refused by the
Building Official, or who may consider that the provisions of this Building Code do not cover
the point raised, or that any particular provisions would cause a manitest injury to be done,
may appeal to the Board ot Appeals by serving written notice on the Building Official in which
it shall be stated that the applicant desiring to use the alternate materials or types of
construction shall guarantee payments of all expenses for necessary tests made or ordered
by the Board of Appeals. Such notice shall be at once transmitted to the Board, which Board
shall arrange a hearing on the particular point raised. The Board shall meet upon notice of
the Chairman within twenty-one (21) days of the filing of an appeal. It shall be the
responsibility of the applicant to notify other interested parties they would like present at the
meeting.

(D) Authority of Board. The Board of Appeals shall interpret the provisions of this Code to cover
a special case, if it appears that the provisions of this Code do not definitely cover the point
raised or that a manifest injustice might be done; provided, that every such decision shall be
by the concurring vote by three members of the Board. The decision on the use of alternate



5-104.4

5-104.5

5-104.6

5-104.7

. e

materials and types of construction shall be by majority vote and if not permitted by this
Building Code shall become effective only when authorized by an amendment to this Code.

PERMITS REQUIRED.
Section 106.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Permits Required. Except as specified in Section 106.2 of this section, no building or structure
regulated by this Code shall be erected, constructed, enlarged, altered, repaired, moved, improved,
removed, converted or demolished unless a separate permit for each buiiding or structure has been
obtained from the Building Official. The required procedure for moving structures is contained in
Chapter XVI, Article 7, of the Code of the City of Lawrence. The required procedure for
demoiishing structures is contained in Chapter V, Article 10, of the Code of the City of Lawrence.

WORK EXEMPT FROM PERMIT.
Section 106.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

7. Decks, platforms, walks and driveways not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above grade and not
over any basement or story below.

APPLICATION FOR PERMIT.
Section 106.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Submittal documents. With each application for a building permit, and when required by the
Building Official for enforcement of any provisions of this Code, two (2) sets of plans and
specifications shall be submitted. The Building Official shall require plans and specifications to be
prepared and designed by an engineer or architect, licensed in the State of Kansas to practice as
such, and shall bear the seal of the engineer or architect.

EXCEPTION: When authorized by the Building Official, plans and specifications need not be
prepared by a licensed engineer or architect for the following:

(1) One-story buildings of Type V conventional wood-stud construction with an area not
exceeding six hundred (600) square feet.

(2) Group U Occupancies of Type V conventional wood-stud construction.

(3) Small work lacking in technical difficulty.

4 Residential structures, when the building does not provide for the housing of more

than two (2) families.

EXPIRATION.
Section 106.4.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Expiration. Every permit issued by the Building Official under the provisions of this Code shall expire
by limitation and become null and void if the building or work authorized by such permit is not
commenced within 180 days from the date of such permit, or if the building or work authorized by
such permit is suspended or abandoned at any item after the work is commenced for a period of 180
days. Before such work can be recommenced, a new permit shall be first obtained to do so, and the
fee therefor shall be one half the amount required for a new permit for such work, provided no
changes have been made or will be made in the original plans and specifications for such work; and
provided further that such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one year. In order to
renew action on a permit after expiration, the permittee shall pay a new full permit fee. Any permittee
holding an un-expired permit may apply for an extension of the time within which work may
commence under that permit when the permittee is unable to commence work within the time
required by this section for good and satisfactory reasons. The Building Official may extend the time
for action by the permittee for a pericd not exceeding 180 days on written request by the permittee
showing that circumstances beyond the control of the permittee have prevented action from being
taken. No permit shall be extended more than once. Upon expiration of the original permit, an
extended permit, or a subsequent permit, abandonment or incompletion of the construction project
may cause the Environmental Code of the City of Lawrence to be applied.



5-104.8

5-104.9

5-104.10

5-104.11

5-104.12

R

HISTORIC PROPERTY.
Section 106.4.4.1 is hereby added to read as follows:

Historic Property. Whenever a building permit is required by this Code regarding work to be
performed on a site, structure or object which is:

(1) A landmark or within the area of an Historic District, or their environs; or,

2) A nominated landmark, as defined in Chapter 22 of this Code. Then a copy of the
application filed by the applicant shall be forwarded to the Historic Resources
Commission and no building permit may be issued on such application until the
applicant has obtained a Certificate of Appropriateness or Certificate of Economic
Hardship for such work.

PERMIT FEES.
Section 107.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Permit Fees. The fee for each permit shall be as set forth in Table No. 1-A. The determination of
value or valuation under any of the provisions of this Code shall be made by the Building Official after
review of the latest building valuation data supplied in the most recent printing of the Building
Standards magazine. The value to be used in computing the building permit and building plan review
fees shall be the fotal value of all construction work for which the permit is issued as well as all finish
work, painting, roofing, electrical, plumbing, heating, air conditioning, elevators, fire-extinguishing
systems and any other permanent equipment.

PERMIT FEES.
Section 107.3.1 has hereby been added to read as follows:

Fees for remodeling, repairing and alteration.
The applicant for a permit to remodel, repair, alter or convert any building shall, at the time of filing an
application for such permit, pay to the City a fee computed by Table No. 1-A.

PERMIT FEES.
Section 107.3.2 has hereby been added to read as follows:

Record of Fees. The Building Official shall keep or cause to be kept an accurate account of fees
collected and received under the provisions of this Section and record the name of the person on
whose account the same was paid, the date and the amount thereof together with the location of the
proposed construction or installation to which the fees relate. He/she shall deposit the amount of the
fees collected with the City Treasurer.

FEES.
Table 1-A is hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE NO.1-A BUILDING PERMIT FEES

TOTAL VALUATION FEE

$1 to $500 $10.00

$501 to $2,000 $11.25 for the first $500 plus $1.50 for sach additiona!
$100 or raction thereof, to and including $2,000

$2,001 to $25,000 : $33.75 for the first $2,000 plus $6.75 for each
additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including
$25,000

$25,001 to $50,000 $189 for the first $25,000 plus $4.90 for each additional

$1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including $50,000

$50,001 to $100,000 $310 for the first $50,000 plus $3.40 for each additional
$1,000 or fraction thereof, 1o and including $100,000



5-104.13

5-104.14

. ~_

$100,001 to $500,000 $480 for the first $100,000 plus $2.60 for each
additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including
$500,000

$500,001 to $1,000,000 $1,530 for the first $500,000 pius $2.25 for each
additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including
$1,000,000

$1,000,001 to $5,000,000 2,655 for the first $1,000,000 plus $1.50 for each
additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including
$5,000,000

$5,000,001 to $15,000,000 $8,655 for the first $5,000,000 plus $0.75 for sach
additional $1,000 or fraction thereof, to and including
$15,000,000

$15,000,001 and above ‘ $16,155 for the first $15,000,000 plus $0.50 for

sach additional $1,000 or fraction thersof,

Other Inspections and Fees:

n Inspections outside of normal business hours $30.00 per hour*
{minimum charges - two hours)

2) Reinspection fess when assessed by the building official ~ $30.00 per hour*
under the provisions of Section 108.8

(3} Inspections for which no fee is specifically indicated $30.00 per hour*
(minimum charge - one-half hour)

4 Additional plan review required by changes, additions
Or revisions to approved plans $30.00 per hour.

{minimum charge - cne-half hour)

*Or the total hourly cost to the jurisdiction, whichever is the greatest. This cost shall include supervision, overhead,
equipment, hourly wages and fringe benefits of the employees involved.

INSPECTIONS.
Section 108.5.5 is hereby amended by deleting this section:

Lath or gypsum board inspection. To be made after all lathing and gypsum board, interior and
exterior, is in place but before any plastering is applied or before gypsum board joints and fasteners
are taped and finished.

MIXED USE OR OCCUPANCY.
Section 302.4, Exception 3. is hereby amended to read as foliows:

Fire Ratings for Occupancy Separations. Occupancy separations shall be provided between the
various groups and divisions of occupancies as set forth in Table No. 3-B. For required separation of
specific uses in Group 1, Division 1 hospitals and nursing homes, see Table 3-C. See also Section
504.6.1.

EXCEPTIONS:

3. In the one-hour occupancy separaticn between a Group R, Division 3 and Group U
QOccupancy, the separation may be limited to the installation of materials approved for one-hour fire-
resistive construction on the garage side and a tight-fitling solid-wood door 1 3/8 inches(3% mm) in
thickness, or a tight-fitting door having a fire-protection rating of not less than 20 minutes when
tested in accordance with Part Il of U.B.C. Standard 7-2, which is a part of this Code, is permitted in
lieu of a one-hour fire assembly. Fire dampers need not be installed in air ducts passing through the
wall, floor or ceiling separating a Group R, Division il Occupancy from a Group U Qccupancy,
provided such ducts within the Group U Occupancy are constructed of steel having a thickness not
less than 0.019 inch (0.48 mm}{No. 26 galvanized sheet gauge} and having no openings into the
Group U Occupancy.




5-104.15

5-104.16

5-104.17

~ ~

REQUIREMENTS FOR GROUP E OCCUPANCIES.
Section 305.1, Division 3 is hereby amended to read as foliows:

Division 3. Any building used for day-care purposes for mora than 12 children.

SPECIAL PROVISIONS.
Section 305.2.3 Exception 2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

EXCEPTIONS:

2. In buildings equipped with an automatic sprinkler system throughout, rooms used for
kindergarten, first and second grade children or for day-care purposes may be located on the second
story, provided there are at least two exits directly to the exterior for the exclusive use of such
occupants. Any existing licensed child care centers which have cantinuously occupied a second
story for day-care purposes since June 15, 1982, may continue their use provided that all
other Fire and Building Code requirements are met.

REQUIREMENTS FOR GROUP R OCCUPANCIES.
Section 310.4, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Access and Means of Egress Facilities. Means of egress shall be provided as specified in
Chapter 10. (See also Section 1007.6.2 for exit markings.)

Access to, and egress from, buildings required to be accessible shall be provided as
specified in Chapter 11,

Basements in dwelling units and every sleeping room below the fourth story shall have at
least one operable window or door approved for emergency escape or rescue that shall open
directly inio a public street, public alley, yard or exit court. The emergency door or window
shall be operabie from the inside to provide a full, clear opening without the use of separate

tools.
EXCEPTIONS:
1. The window or door may open into an atrium complying with Section 402 provided the

window or door opens onto an exit balcony and the dwelling unit or guest room has an exit which
does not open into the atrium.

2. Existing dwelling units or dwelling units under construction, prior to the adoption date of this
Code, will be required to install an operable window or door for emergency escape or rescue
complying with this section of the Code when the finished area of the basement is fifty percent or
more of the total square footage of the basement area, or when sleeping room(s) are located within

the basement.

Escape or rescue windows shall have a minimum net clear openable area of 5.7 square feet
{0.53m?). The minimum net ciear openable height dimension shall be 24 inches (610 mm). The
minimum net clear openable width dimension shall be 20 inches (508 mm). When windows are
provided as a means of escape or rescue, they shall have a finished sill height not more than 44
inches (1118 mm) above the floor.

Escape and rescue windows with a finished sill height below the adjacent ground elevation shall have
a window well. Window wells at escape or rescue windows shall comply with the following:

1. The clear herizontal dimensions shall allow the window to be fully opened and provide a minimum
accessible net clear opening of 9 square feet (0.84 m?), with a minimum dimension of 36 inches (214
mm).

2. Window wells with a vertical depth of more than 44 inches (1118 mm) shall be eguipped with an
approved permanently affixed ladder or stairs that are accessible with the window in the fully open



5-104.18

5-104.19

5-104.20

~ ~

position™The ladder or stairs shall not encroach into the required dimensiom.-<i the window well by
more than 6 inches (152 mm).

Bars, grilles, grates or similar devices may be installed on window wells, provided:

1. The devices are equipped with approved release mechanisms which are operable from the inside

without the use of a key or special knowledge or effort; and
2. The building is equipped with smoke detectors installed in accordance with Section 310.9.

SMOKE DETECTORS AND SPRINKLER SYSTEMS.
Section 310.9.1.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Location Within Dwelling Units. In dwelling units, a detector shall be installed in each sleeping
room and at a point centrally located in the corridor or area giving access to each separate sleeping
area. When the dwelling unit has more than one story and in dwellings with basements, a detector
shall be instalied on each story and in the basement. In dwelling units where a story or basement is
split into two or more levels, the smoke detector shall be installed on the upper level, except that
when the lower level contains a sleeping area, a detector shali be installed on each level. When
sleeping rooms are on an upper level, the detector shall be placed at the ceiling of the upper level in
close proximity to the stairway. In dwelling units where the ceiling height of a room open to the
hallway serving the bedrooms exceeds that of the hallway by 24 inches (610 mm) or more, smoke
detectors shall be installed in the hallway and in the adjacent room. Detectors shall be
interconnected and sound an alarm audible in all sleeping areas and on all levels of the dwelling unit
in which they are located.

AUTOMATIC FIRE EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS.
Section 904.2.9 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Group R, Division 1 Occupancies. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout
every apariment house three or more stories in height or containing 16 or more dwelling units, every
congregate residence three or more stories in height or having an occupant load of 20 or more, and
every hotel three or more stories in height or containing 20 or more guest rooms. Residential or
quick-response standard sprinklers shalt be used in the dwslling units in guest room portions of the
building. Mezzanine floors as defined in Section 214 of this Code shall be construed as stories with
regard to this Section.

CHAPTER 11 of the 1997 Uniform Building Code, as referenced herein, shall be repealed, except
to read as follows:

Chapter 11 Accessibility.
Section 1101.2 Standards of Quality. The standard listed below labeled an “Adopted Standard” is
alsa listed in Chapter 35, Part lll, and is part of this Code.

1. Accessibie Design

Adopted Standard—CABO/ANSI A117.1-1998

Section 1101.3 Design. This design and construction of accessible buildings and
building elements shall be in accordance with this chapter and CABO/ANSI A117.1-
1998. For a building to be considered accessible, it shall be designed and
constructed to the minimum provisions of this chapter and CABO/ANS! A117.1.1.

EXCEPTION: Type B dwelling units shall comply with Section 11086.
Section 1103.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

General. Accessibility to temporary or permanent buildings, or portions thereof, shall be provided for
all occupancy classifications in accordance with the current guidelines of Title |l (governmental
facilities) and Title Il (alf other occupancies, including private clubs and religious entities) provisions
of the American's with Disabilities Act (ADA), except as modified by this Chapter. Where there is a
conflict between Chapter 11 of the 1997 Uniform Building Code and Title il and Title Iii of the
American's With Disabilities Act (ADA), the more restrictive raquirement shall be applicable.



5-104.21

5-104.22

5-104.23

5-104.24

5-105

5-106

a ~

~
(A

EXCEPTIONS:
1. Floors or portions of floors not customarily occupied, including but not limited to, elevator pits;

observations galleries used primarily for security purposes; elevator penthouses; unoccupiable
spaces accessed only by ladders, catwalks, crawl spaces of freight elevators; piping and equipment
catwalks; and machinery, mechanical and electrical equipment rooms.

2. Subject to the approval of the Building Official, areas where work cannot reasonably be performed
by persons having a severe impairment (mobility, sight or hearing) need not have specific features
which provide accessibility to such persons.

3. Temporary structures, sites and equipment directily associated with the construction process such
as construction site trailers, scaffolding, bridging or material hoists are not required to be accessible.
This exception does not include walkways or pedestrian protection required by Chapter 30.

SNOW LOADS.
Section 1608 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Buildings, structures and portions thereot shall be designed to sustain snow loads in conformity with
Appendix Chapter 16, Division ll, Snow Load Design, Volume 2, of the Uniform Building Code, 1997
Edition.

FOOTINGS. .
Section 1806.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

General. Footings and foundations shall be constructed of masonry or concrete and shall extend
below the frost line. Footings of concrete and masonry shall be of solid material. Foundations
supporting wood shall extend at least six (6) inches (152 mm) above the adjacent finish grade.
Footings shall have a minimum depth as indicated in Table 18-I-C unless another depth is
recommended by a foundation investigation. The provisions of this section do not appiy to building
and foundation systems in those areas subject to scour and water pressure by wind and wave action.
Buildings and foundations subject to such loads shall be designed in accordance with approved
hational standards.

ADDITIONS, ALTERATIONS OR REPAIRS.
Section 3403.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Historic Buildings. Repairs, alterations and additions necessary for the preservation, restoration,
rehabilitation or continued use of a building or structure may be made without conformance to all the
requirements of this Code when authorized by the Building Official, provided:

1. The building or structure has been designated as a landmark or a contributing or key contributing
site, structure or object within an Historic District, as defined in Chapter 22 of the Code of the City of
Lawrence.

2. Any unsafe conditions as described in this Code are corrected.

3. The restored building or structure will be no more hazardous based on life safety, tire safety and
sanitation than the existing building.

MINIMUM PLUMBING FIXTURES.

Appendix Chapter 29 is hereby adopted. Table A-29-A shall be in effect and in conjunction with
Chapter 11 to determine the minimum number of plumbing fixtures required for the type of building
occupancy.

AUTHORITY TO ISSUE NOTICE TQ APPEAR.

Pursuant to the authority of Charter Ordinance No. 31, the inspector personnel of the Neighborhood
Resources Department are hereby authorized to issue Notice to Appear citations for alleged
violations of the provisions of Chapter 5, Chapter 9 and Chapter 20 of the Code of the City of
Lawrence, Kansas, and amendments thereto.

DISCONNECTION OF CITY SERVICES.

The Governing Body finds that the occupancy or habitation in a structure not in compliance with the
provisions of Chaptar 5 or Chapter 20 of the Code of the City of Lawrence, Kansas, and amendments
thereto, constitutes a hazard to the public heaith, safety and welfare, and that the provision of City



5-107

Section 2.

water, sanitary sewer and/or sanitation services is reasonably related to w.e ability to inhabit or
occupy such a structure. After lawful notice to the customer and the propenty owner concering the
proposed disconnection, the Codes Enforcement Manager shall have the authority to order the
disconnection of City water, sanitary sewer and/or sanitation services serving structures not in
compliance with the provisions of Chapter 5 or Chapter 20 of the Code of the City of Lawrence,
Kansas, and amendments thereto, The disconnection of City services pursuant to this Section shall
only be ordered if the Codes Enforcement Manager makes specific findings concerning the
structure that the disconnection of City water, sanitary sewer and/or sanitation services is necessary
to deter the occupancy or habitation in a structure in which the pubiic health, safety or welfare is

harmed or endangered by continued occupancy or habitation.

UTILITY TRANSFERS WITH A BUILDING PERMIT.

The City Utility Billing Division shall not approve or allow the transtfer of City water, sanitary sewer,
and/or sanitation service for properties or structures for which a building permit has been issued and
has 1) not been issued a certificate of occupancy; 2) not completed a final inspection; or 3) not been
otherwise discontinued pursuant to provisions of the Uniform Building Code, uniless pursuant to the
provisions of this Section. For properties or structures with a current building permit, the transfer of
City water, sanitary sewer, and/or sanitation service to another customer shall be approved by the
Codes Enforcement Division upon a finding that the structure or property complies with the
provisions of Chapter 5 of the Code of the City of Lawrence, Kansas, and amendments thereto,
including provisions regarding final inspection for the property or structures.

Chapter 5, Article 1 of the Code of the City of Lawrence, Kansas 1997 edition and amendments

thereto is hereby repealed it being the intent of this ordinance to supersede the repealed provisions.

Section 3.

Adopted this 31st day of July, 2001.

ATTEST:

This ordinance shall be effective on and after its publication as provided by iaw.

Mo ldomebe

Mike Rundle, Mayor

. 1 .
Diane Trybom, Ecting éity ﬁk

Appr as to form and legality:

M. [ -

David L Corliss\Assistant City Manager and
Director of Legal Services

t' hereby certity that the foregoing is a
o:flclﬁ and'correct_ copy of the original
Inance; tha‘ Said ordinanc&was pass.

edonthe . %1 .
ol dav ot {
229 tha the record of the nzal vote

0N its passage 15 foune

S DEE@ A —— ot

égu::;aa:h_.., e DY i wae pupinh
e Lawrence Daity journat-Wews
on the Oy of '
“Lexd

City Cierk



